EXTMORDINAHY - Regisiared No. M 324

@fge %mhfg @nnemmeni @ageffe

Published Ly Authority

KRRACH: SATURDAY JANUARY 27, 2001

PART-1
GOVERNMENT OF SINDH
LAW DEPARTMENT
NOTIFICATION

Karachi the2® savemay, 2001

No. 8.LEGIS: 1 (9200} The following Ordinance made by the Governor

of Sindh is hereby publish for general infanné_tion:-

o THE SINDH FINANCIAL LAWS ( AMENDMENT).
Ll . ORDINANCE , 200!

Sindh Ordinance No. IX of 200!

AN
ORDINANCE

to rationalize and abolish certain taxes and fees in the Province of
Sindh,

WHEREAS it is expedient to rationalize and abolish certain taxes
and fees in the Province of Sindh:

LV)-269-EX-1-33 o

Preamble,

Price Rs. 4.00



Short title and
commencement

Amendment of
section 4. of W.
P. Act V of

- 1958,

Amendment of
schedule of
W.E. Act
HHXI of 1958,

£33 TH'E"SINDH GOVT. GAZETTE EXT.JAMRY27,  200LPART I-

AND WHEREAS the Provincial Assembly stands suspended in
pursuance of the Proclamation of the fourteenth day of Cctober, 1999, and
the Provisional Constitution Order No.| of 1999;

AND WHEREAS the Governor of Sindh is satisfied that
circumstances exist which render it necessary to take immediate action;

NOW, THEREFORE, in pursuance of the aforesaid Proclamation
and the Provisional Constitution Order read with Provisional Constitution
(Amendment) Order No.9 of 1999, and in exercise of all powers enabi...g
him in that behalf, the Governor of Sindh is pleased to make and promulgate
the following Ordinance:-

1. (1)- This Ordinance may be called the Sindh Financial Laws
{Amendment) Ordinance, 2001

(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. In the Sindh Urban Immovable Property Tax Act, 1958, in section 4-

(a) in clause (c), in sub-clause(i), for the words “six
hundred”, the words “eight hundred and sixty four”
shall be substituted:

(b) in clause (g), for the words “five thousand”, the
words “seven thousand and two hundred” shall be
substituted,

‘In the Sindh Mo_tnr Vehicles Taxation Act, 1958, in the Schedule -

(a) in serial Nod4, after clause (i), the following
Explanation shall be inserted :-

“Explanation: For the purpose of this clause, the
seating capacity shall not include the seats meant
for driver and conductor.”,



PART I- THE SINDH GOVT, GAZETTE EXT.JANUARY: 27 200§ 124

(b) in serial No.5 at the end, the following proviso shall
be inserted :-

“Provided that the tax in respect of the motor
vehicles referred to in clauses (a), (b) and (c) other
than the commercial vehicles shall, on completion
of ten years and fifteen years of the payment of
the tax since first registration of the wehicles,
be paid at the rate of seventy five percent

and fifty percent of the tax, respectively.”.

4. Inthe Sindh Finance Act, 1990, section § and 9 shall be omitted.

5. Inthe Sindh Finance Act, 1994, section 7 shall be omitted.

Omission of
section 8 and 9
of Sindh Act IV
of 1990,

Omission of
secton 7 of
Sindh Act XIII
of 1994.

Karachi, . MOHAMMEDMIAN SOOMRO
Dated: 294 Jan: 2001 GOVERNOR OF SINDH
% SAYED GHULAM NABI SHAH

SECRETARY TO GOVERNMENT OF SIHIJH
- LAW DEPARTMENT

(1250)-27-01-200] :’aFHE?')

H&Rﬂﬂﬂl FRIP‘ITED AT TI‘IE SI]"[DH GD‘JEEHMEHT PRESS

i



