EXTRAORDINARY Registered No. M324

The Sindh Gobernment Gazette

Published by Authqril:}'
KARACHI MONDAY APRIL. 1,2013

PART-1V

PROVINCIAL ASSEMBLY OF SINDH
NOTIFICATION

KARACHI, THE 1°7 APRIL, 2013.

MO.PAS/Legis-B-04/2009- The Sindh Assembly Members {Salaries
and Allowances) {Amendment) Bill, 2009 having been passed by the
Provincial Assembly of Sindh an 15" March, 2013 and assented to by
the Governor of Sirdh on 28" March, 2013 is hereby published as an
Act of the Legislature of Sindh.

THE SINDH ASSEMBLY MEMBERS (SALARIES AND -
ALLOWANCES) (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2009.

SINDH ACT NO. XXXIV OF 2013.

AN
ACT

to amend the Sind Assembly Members (>alaries

and Allowances) Act, 1974.
L]

WHEREAS it is expedient to amend the Sind Preamble.

Assembly Members (Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1974,
in the manner herainafter appearing;

Liv- 180& Ext -IV-22A (323A) « Price Rs. 15.00



3238

THE SINDH GOVT. GAZETTE_EXT. APRIL 1, 2013

PART-"Y

Short title and
commencement.

Amendment of Section 3
of the Sind Act No. XXVI
of 1974,

Amendment of Sectic 3-
A of the Sind Act No. XXVI
of 1974,

Amendment of Section 32-
B of the Sind Act Mo. x<VI
af 1973,

Armmendment of Section 3-
C of the sind Act No. XXVI
of 1974,

Addition of Section 3-D of
the Sind Act No. XXVT of
1974,

Amendment of Section 4
of the Sind Act Mo, XXVI
of 1974 o

Amendment of Section 4-
B of the Sind Act No. XXVI
of 1974,

Amendment of Section 5
of the Sind Act No. XXVI
of 1974,

Amendment of Section 5-
A of the Sind Act Mo, X¥VI
of 1974,

10.

It is hereby enacted as follows:-

(1) This At may be called the Sindh Assembly
Members (Salaries and Allowances) (Amendmant) Act,
2009,

(2] I chall come into force at once ard shall ba
deamed to have taken effect on and from 1% lialy, 2011,

In the Sindh Aszsembly Membars (Salaries and
Allowances) Act, 1974, hereinafter referred to as the said
Act, In sectlon 3, for the words "fifteen thousand®, the
words "twenty four thousand” shall be substituted.

In the said Act, 0 section 3-8, for the words
“three thousand”, the words “four thousard eight
hundred” shal! be substitutad,

In the said Act, In section 3-B, for the words "ten
thousand® the words “sixteen thousand” shall be

substituted.

In the sald Act, in section 3-C, for the words
“thre¢ thousand”, the words “four thousand eight
hundred”, shall be substitatec.

In Ehe said Act, afler section 3-C, the following
new Section shall be added;

"3-0r The salary and other emoluments shall
autamatically be increased by Goverpment [n fropartian
increase to be made in the salary cf the civil servants in
BPS-22, from time to timea.”

‘In tne said Act, in section 4, for the words “five
hundred and fifly rupees”, and for the words “four
hurdred rupees”, the words "Eight hundred elghty
rupees” and the words “six nundred forty rupees” shall
respectively be supstituted,

In the said Act, in section 4-B, for the words “one
thousand and five hundred”, the words “two thousand
four hundred”, shall be substituted.

In the said Act, in section 5, in sob-section {1) In
the provise, for the words “three rupees”, the words
“iwenty rupees” shall be substituted.

In the said Ack, In section S5-A-
(1) In sub-section (1), for the words “forty thousand
rupees” the words “one hundred and twenty thousand
rupees” shall be substituted; and

(it} in the =sub-section (2], for the words “thirty
thousand rupees bears to the sum of forty thousand
rupeas” the words “one hundred thousand rupees” shall

be substityted,



CARTIV

11

1,

in the saicd Act, in section 6, after sub-section
[2), the following shall be add d:

“£3) A member shall be eni Lo receive mobile
phone charges at the rate of tan thousand rupees per
marth.”

In the said Act, n section 6-B, for the words “five
tholsand® the waords =iaht thousand” shall  be
substituted,

THE SINDH GOVT. GAZ ]

Amendment of Section 6
of the Sind Act No. XXVI
of 1974,

Amendment of Section G-
B of the Sind Act No. XXVI
o 1974,

BY ORDER OF THE SPEAKER
PROVINCIAL ASSEMBLY OF SINDH

G.M.UMAR FAROOQ
ACTING SECRETARY
PROVINCIAL ASSEMBLY OF SINDH

Karachi: Printed at the Sindh Government Press

1-4-2013



	1 (1).pdf
	1 (2).pdf
	1 (3).pdf

