SINDH ORDINANCE NO.VIII OF 1970

THE SIND ABKARI ACT (AMENDMENT) ORDINANCE, 1970

[27th October, 1970]

An Ordinance to amend the Sind Abkari Act, 1878.

WHEREAS it is expedient to amend the Sind Abkari Act,
1878, in the manner hereinafter appearing;

NOW, THEREFORE, in pursuance of the Martial Law
Proclamation of 25" March, 1969, read with the Provisional
Constitution Order, and in exercise of all powers enabling him in
that behalf, the Governor of Sind is pleased to make and
promulgate the following Ordinance :-

1. (1) This Ordinance may be called the Sind Abkari Act
(Amendment) Ordinance, 1970.

(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. In the Sind Abkari Act, 1978, hereinafter referred to as the
said Act, in section 44, for the words “two hundred rupees”, the
words “one thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

3. In section 45 of the said Act, for the words “three months
or with fine which may extend to two hundred rupees or with
both”, the words and commas “one year, or with fine which
may extend to one thousand rupees, or with both” shall be
substituted.

4, In section 45A of the said Act, for the words “two hundred
rupees”, the words “one thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

5. In section 46 of the said Act, for the words and commas
“five hundred rupees, or with imprisonment for a term which
may extend to three months, or with both” the words and
commas “one thousand rupees, or with imprisonment which
may extend to one year, or with both” shall be substituted.

6. In section 55A of the said Act, for the words “two hundred
rupees”, the words “one thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

Preamble.

Short title and
commencement.

Amendment of
section 44 of Sind
Act V of 1878.

Amendment of
section 45 of Sind
Act V of 1878.

Amendment of
section 45A of
Sind Act V of
1878.
Amendment of
section 46 of Sind
Act V of 1878.

Amendment of
section 55A of
Sind Act V of
1878.



