SIND ORDINANCE NO. Il OF 1984
THE SIND FINANCE ORDINANCE, 1984

CONTENTS

Preamble

Sections

1. Short title and commencement.
2. Amendment of section 4 of West Pakistan Act, V of 1958.



SIND ORDINANCE NO. Il OF 1984
THE SIND FINANCE ORDINANCE, 1984

[19t July, 1984]

An Ordinance to make provision for grant of certain tax
relief.

WHEREAS it is expedient to grant certain tax relief in the
manner hereinafter appearing;

NOW, THEREFORE, in Pursuance of the Proclamation of
the fifth day of July, 1977, and the Provisional Constitution Order, 1981,
the Governor of Sind is pleased to make and promulgate the
following Ordinance -—

1. (1) This Ordinance may be called the Sind Finance
Ordinance, 1984.

(2) It shall come into force at once and be deemed to
have taken effect on and from the 1st day of July, 1984.

2. In the Sind Urban Immovable Property Tax Act, 1958, in
section 4—

(i) In clause (c), in sub-clause (i), for the words “five
hundred rupees”, the words “six hundred rupees”
shall be substituted;

(i) In clause (g), for the words “three thousand and
five hundred rupees” the words “five thousand
rupees” shall be substituted.

Preamble.

Short title, and
commencement.

Amendment of
section 4 of West
Pakistan Act, V of
1958.



