
SIND ORDINANCE NO. VII OF 1976 
 

THE PROVINCIAL MOTOR VEHICLES (SIND AMENDMENT) ORDINANCE, 1976  
 

[26
th

 October, 1976] 

 

          An Ordinance further to amend the Provincial Motor 

Vehicles Ordinance, 1965, in its application to the Province of 

Sind.  

 

 

         WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Provincial 

Motor Vehicles Ordinance, 1965, in its application to the 

Province of Sind, in the manner hereinafter appearing;  

 

Preamble. 

 AND WHEREAS the Provincial Assembly is not in session 

and the Governor of Sind is satisfied that circumstances exist 

which render it necessary to take immediate action; 

 

 

         NOW, THEREFORE, in exercise of the powers conferred by 

clause (1) of Article 128 of the Constitution of the Islamic 

Republic of Pakistan, the Governor of Sind is pleased to make 

and promulgate the following Ordinance :- 

 

 

1. (1) This Ordinance may be called the Provincial Motor 

Vehicles (Sind Amendment) Ordinance, 1976. 

 

     (2) It shall come into force at once. 

 

Short title and  

commencement. 

2.   In the Provincial Motor Vehicles Ordinance, 1965, in its 

application to the Province of Sind, in section 50, in clause (a) of 

sub-section (1), for the words “eight thousand”, the words 

“fifteen thousand”, shall be substituted. 

Amendment of 

section 50 of 

West Pakistan 

Ordinance XIX of 

1965. 

 

3.  In the said Ordinance, in section 67— 

 

(a) in sub-section (1), between the word “carriage” 

and the word “as”, the words “or by the 

Corporation if such carriage belongs to the 

Corporation” shall be inserted; 

 

(b) in clause (a) of sub-section (1), for the words 

“eight thousand”, the words “fifteen thousand” 

shall be substituted. 

 

 

Amendment of 

section 67 of 

West Pakistan 

Ordinance XIX of 

1965. 

 

4.  In the said Ordinance, in the Sixth Schedule, after the 

last entry before note 1, the following shall be added :-- 

 

   “Badin    …. BD.”. 

Amendment of 

Sixth Schedule to 

West Pakistan 

Ordinance XIX of 

1965. 

 

 



SIND ORDINANCE NO. VII OF 1976 
 

THE PROVINCIAL MOTOR VEHICLES (SIND AMENDMENT) ORDINANCE, 1976  
 

 

5.  For the Thirteenth Schedule to the said Ordinance, the 

following shall be substituted:-- 

Substitution of 

Thirteenth 

Schedule to West 

Pakistan 

Ordinance XIX of 

1965. 
 

 

“THIRTEENTH SCHEDULE 

(See sections 50,53 and 67) 
 

SCALE OF COMPENSATION PAYABLE ON INJURY TO A PASSENGER IN A STAGE 

CARRIAGE OR CONTRACT CARRIAGE 

 

Sr. 

No. 

Injury Compensation 

Rs. 

1. Loss of right arm above or at the elbow 4,000 

2. Loss of left arm above or at the elbow 4,000 

3. Loss of right arm below the elbow 3,500 

4. Loss of left arm below the elbow 3,500 

5. Loss of leg at or above the knee 4,000 

6. Loss of leg below the knee 3,500 

7. Permanent loss of hearing 4,000 

8. Loss of one eye 4,500 

9. Loss of both eyes 8,000 

10. Loss of thumb 2,000 

11. Loss of toes on one foot 3,000 

12. Loss of index finger 2,000 

13. Loss of great toe 1,500 

14. Loss of any finger other than index finger 1,500 

15. Permanent disfiguration of face or head 1,500 to 

           4,000 on the  

gravity of the 

disfiguration.  

16. Fracture or dislocation of a bone 1,500 

17. Emasculation 3,500 

18. Loss of one or more teeth                 500 for 

one, for more 2,000 

 

 



SIND ORDINANCE NO. VII OF 1976 
 

THE PROVINCIAL MOTOR VEHICLES (SIND AMENDMENT) ORDINANCE, 1976  
 

 

 

19. Any injury which endangers life or which causes 

the sufferer to be, during the space of twenty 

days in sever bodily pain, or unable to follow his 

ordinary pursuit. 

1,500 

20. Medical expenses for any injury not specified in 

this Schedule. 

Actual expenses 

certified by a 

Medical Officer. 

 

Note:-- Maximum compensation payable for more than one injury shall be       

limited to rupees ten thousand.”. 


