
SINDH ORDINANCE NO. XXIII OF 2002. 

THE SINDH MINISTERS (SALARIES, ALLOWANCES AND PRIVILEGES) 

(AMENDMENT) ORDINANCE, 2002. 
 

 

[15
th  

July, 2002] 

 

An   Ordinance   to   amend   the   Sindh   Ministers   (Salaries, 

Allowances and Privileges) Act, 1975. 

WHEREAS    it  is  expedient  to  amend  the  Sindh  Ministers 

(Salaries,  Allowances  and  Privileges)  Act,  1975,  in  the  manner 

hereinafter appearing; 

Preamble.

 

AND WHEREAS the Provincial Assembly stands dissolved in 

pursuance  of  the  Proclamation  of  the  fourteenth  day of  October, 

1999, and the Provisional Constitution Order No. 1 of 1999; 
 

AND WHEREAS the Governor of Sindh is satisfied that 

circumstances exist which render it necessary to take immediate 

action; 
 

NOW, THEREFORE,  in pursuance of the Proclamation and the 

Provisional Constitution Order read with Provisional Constitution 

(Amendment) Order No. 9 of 1999, and in exercise of all powers 

enabling him in that behalf, the Governor of Sindh is pleased to make 

and promulgate the following Ordinance:- 

1. (1)  This Ordinance may be called the Sindh Ministers (Salaries, 

Allowances and Privileges) (Amendment) Ordinance, 2002. 

 

(2)  It shall be come into force at once and shall be deemed to 

have taken effect on and from 1
st 

December, 2001. 

2.             In     the     Sindh     Ministers     (Salaries,     Allowances     and 

Privileges)Act,1975 hereinafter referred to as the said Act, in section 

5, for the words “Twenty one thousand”, the words “thirty two 

thousand” and for the words “eighteen thousand”, the words “twenty 

seven thousand” shall be substituted. 

Short title and 

commencement. 
 

 
 
 
 

Amendment of 

section   5   of   Act 

VIII of 1975.

3.  In the said Act, in section 7, for sub-section (2), the following 
shall be substituted- 

 
“(2)  Where a Minister is not provided with an official residence 

or prefers to reside in his own house or a private residence, he 

shall be paid thirty five thousand rupees per mensem and shall, in 

addition, be paid a sum of sixty thousand rupees for furnishing 

the house  only once whether he is appointed Minister or elected 

as Speaker or Deputy Speaker for any number of occasion either 

during the first tenure of the Assembly after the tenth day of 

March, 1985,  or on election of a new Assembly.” 
 

4.  In the said Act, in section 10, for the words “four hundred and 
fifty”, the words “five hundred and fifty” shall be substituted. 

Amendment of 

section   7   of   Act 

VIII of 1975. 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Amendment of 

section 10 of Act 

VIII of 1975. 

http://sindhlaws.gov.pk/setup/publications_SindhCode/PUB-15-000280.pdf
http://sindhlaws.gov.pk/setup/publications_SindhCode/PUB-15-000280.pdf
http://sindhlaws.gov.pk/setup/publications_SindhCode/PUB-15-000280.pdf
http://sindhlaws.gov.pk/setup/publications_SindhCode/PUB-15-000280.pdf
http://sindhlaws.gov.pk/setup/publications_SindhCode/PUB-15-000280.pdf
http://sindhlaws.gov.pk/setup/publications_SindhCode/PUB-15-000280.pdf
http://sindhlaws.gov.pk/setup/publications_SindhCode/PUB-15-000280.pdf
http://sindhlaws.gov.pk/setup/publications_SindhCode/PUB-15-000280.pdf
http://sindhlaws.gov.pk/setup/publications_SindhCode/PUB-15-000280.pdf

