
SIND ORDINANCE NO.IV OF 1985. 
 

THE SIND CO-OPERATIVE HOUSING AUTHORITY (AMENDMENT) ORDINANCE, 1985. 
 

[24th June, 1985]. 

  

 

          An Ordinance to amend the Sind Co-operative Housing 

Authority Ordinance, 1982. 

  

 

         WHEREAS it is expedient to amend the Sind Co-operative 

Housing Authority Ordinance, 1982, in the manner hereinafter 

appearing; 

  

Preamble. 

  AND WHEREAS The Provincial Assembly is not in session 

and the Governor of Sind is satisfied that circumstances exist 

which render it necessary to take immediate action; 

 
 

 

  NOW, THEREFORE, in exercise of the powers conferred 

by clause (1) of Article 128 of the Constitution of the Islamic 

Republic of Pakistan, the Governor of Sind is pleased to make 

and promulgate the following Ordinance :- 

 
 

 

1.  (1)     This Ordinance may be called the Sind Co-

operative Housing Authority (Amendment) Ordinance, 1985. 

 

 (2) It shall come into force at once. 

  

Short title and 

commencement.  

2. In the Sind Co-operative Housing Authority Ordinance, 

1982, hereinafter referred to as the said Ordinance, section 14— 

 

(i) in sub-section (1), for the words “six months”, the 

words “one year” shall be substituted; 

(ii) in sub-section (2), for the words “one year”, the 

words “two years” shall be substituted. 

 

Amendment of 

section 14 of Sind 

Ordinance V of 

1982. 

3. In the said Ordinance, after section 14, the following 

section 14-A shall be inserted:- 

 

“14-A.  No person, who has been removed from or is 

otherwise disqualified to hold any office of the society 

under the Sind Co-operative Societies Act, 1925 or the 

rules thereunder or the bye-laws of the society shall 

be eligible to contest the election under sub-section 

(1) of section 14, unless a period of two years or such 

Insertion of 

section 14-A in 

Sind Ordinance 

V of 1982. 



SIND ORDINANCE NO.IV OF 1985. 
 

THE SIND CO-OPERATIVE HOUSING AUTHORITY (AMENDMENT) ORDINANCE, 1985. 
 

less period as Government may specify in any case, 

has elapsed since his removal or disqualification, as 

the case may be.”. 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 


