SINDH ORDINANCE NO.VII OF 1993

THE PROVINCIAL SMALL CAUSES COURTS (SINDH AMENDMENT)

ORDINANCE,1993.

An Ordinance to amend the Provincial Small Causes Courts Act, 1887,
in its application to the Province of Sindh.

WHEREAS it is expedient to amend the Provincial Small Causes
Courts Act, 1887, in its application to the Province of Sindh, in the manner
hereinafter appearing;

AND WHEREAS The Provincial Assembly is not in session and
the Governor of Sindh is satisfied that circumstances exist which render it
necessary to take immediate action;

NOW, THEREFORE, in exercise of the powers conferred by
clause (1) of Article 128 of the Constitution of the Islamic Republic of
Pakistan, the Governor of Sindh is pleased to make and promulgate the
following Ordinance :-

1. 1) This Ordinance may be called the Provincial Small Causes
Courts (Sindh Amendment) Ordinance, 1993.

(2 It shall come into force on and from the 1% July, 1993.

2. In the Provincial Small Causes Courts Act, 1887, in its application to
the Province of Sindh, hereinafter referred to as the said Act, in section 15—

Q) in sub-section (2), for the words “two thousand”, the words
“twenty five thousand” shall be substituted;

(i) in sub-section (3), for the words “five thousand”, the words
“fifty thousand” shall be substituted.

3. In the said Act, in section 27-A, in sub-section (1), for the words “two
thousand” and the words “five thousand”, the words “twenty five thousand”
and the words “fifty thousand” shall respectively be substituted.

[22™ July, 1993]

Preamble.

Short title and
commencement.

Amendment of
section 15 of Act IX
of 1887.

Amendment of
section 27-A of Act
IX of 1887.



