
SINDH ACT NO. XXXIV OF 2013. 

THE SINDH ASSEMBLY MEMBERS (SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES) (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2013. 

 

 

[1st April, 2013] 

 
An   Act   to   amend   the   Sind   Assembly   Members 

(Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1974. 
 

WHEREAS    it    is    expedient    to    amend    the    Sind 

Assembly  Members  (Salaries  and  Allowances)  Act,  1974,  in 

the manner hereinafter appearing; 

Preamble.

 

It is hereby enacted as follows:- 
 

1.        (1)        This  Act  may  be  called  the  Sindh  Assembly 

Members (Salaries and Allowances) (Amendment) Act, 2009. 
 

(2)       It shall come into force at once and shall be 

deemed to have taken effect on and from 1st July, 2011. 

Short title and 

commencement.

 
 

2.        In   the   Sindh   Assembly   Members   (Salaries   and 

Allowances) Act, 1974, hereinafter referred to as the said Act, 

in section 3, for the words “fifteen thousand”, the words 

“twenty four thousand” shall be substituted. 

Amendment of 

Section 3 of the Sind 

Act No. XXVI  of 1974.

 

3.        In the said Act, in section  3-A, for the words “three 

thousand”, the words “four thousand eight hundred” shall be 

substituted. 

Amendment of 
Section 3-A of the Sind 

Act No. XXVI  of 1974.

 

4.          In  the  said  Act,  in  section  3-B,  for  the  words  “ten 

thousand” the words “sixteen thousand” shall be substituted. 

Amendment of 
Section 3-B of the Sind 

Act No. XXVI  of 1974.

5.          In the said Act, in section 3-C, for the words “three 

thousand”, the words “four thousand eight hundred”, shall be 

substituted. 

Amendment of 

Section 3-C of the Sind 
Act No. XXVI  of 1974.

 

6.            In the said Act, after section 3-C, the following new 

section shall be added: 
 

 

“3-D The salary and other emoluments 

shall automatically be increased by 

Government  in   proportion   increase   to   be 

made  in  the  salary  of  the  civil  servants  in 

BPS-22, from time to time.” 

Addition of Section 

3-D of the Sind Act 
No. XXVI  of 1974.

http://sindhlaws.gov.pk/setup/publications_SindhCode/PUB-15-000278.pdf
http://sindhlaws.gov.pk/setup/publications_SindhCode/PUB-15-000278.pdf
http://sindhlaws.gov.pk/setup/publications_SindhCode/PUB-15-000278.pdf
http://sindhlaws.gov.pk/setup/publications_SindhCode/PUB-15-000278.pdf
http://sindhlaws.gov.pk/setup/publications_SindhCode/PUB-15-000278.pdf
http://sindhlaws.gov.pk/setup/publications_SindhCode/PUB-15-000278.pdf
http://sindhlaws.gov.pk/setup/publications_SindhCode/PUB-15-000278.pdf
http://sindhlaws.gov.pk/setup/publications_SindhCode/PUB-15-000278.pdf
http://sindhlaws.gov.pk/setup/publications_SindhCode/PUB-15-000278.pdf
http://sindhlaws.gov.pk/setup/publications_SindhCode/PUB-15-000278.pdf
http://sindhlaws.gov.pk/setup/publications_SindhCode/PUB-15-000278.pdf
http://sindhlaws.gov.pk/setup/publications_SindhCode/PUB-15-000278.pdf
http://sindhlaws.gov.pk/setup/publications_SindhCode/PUB-15-000278.pdf
http://sindhlaws.gov.pk/setup/publications_SindhCode/PUB-15-000278.pdf
http://sindhlaws.gov.pk/setup/publications_SindhCode/PUB-15-000278.pdf


SINDH ACT NO. XXXIV OF 2013. 

THE SINDH ASSEMBLY MEMBERS (SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES) (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2013. 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 

7.          In  the  said  Act,  in  section  4,  for  the  words  “five 

hundred and fifty rupees”, and for the words “four hundred 

rupees”, the words “Eight hundred eighty rupees” and the 

words “six hundred forty rupees” shall respectively be 

substituted. 

Amendment of 

Section 4 of the Sind 

Act No. XXVI  of 1974.

 

8.         In  the  said  Act,  in  section  4-B,  for  the  words  “one 

thousand and five hundred”, the words “two thousand four 

hundred”, shall be substituted. 

Amendment of 

Section 4-B of the Sind 
Act No. XXVI  of 1974.

 

9.          In the said Act, in section 5, in sub-section (1) in the 

proviso, for the words “three rupees”, the words “twenty 

rupees” shall be substituted. 

Amendment of 

Section 5 of the Sind 

Act No. XXVI  of 1974.

 

10.       In the said Act, in section 5-A- 
 

 

(i) in sub-section (1), for the words “forty thousand 

rupees” the words “one hundred and twenty 

thousand rupees” shall be substituted; and 
 

 

(ii)   i n the sub-section (2), for the words “thirty thousand 

rupees bears to the sum of forty thousand rupees” 

the words “one hundred thousand rupees” shall be 

substituted. 

Amendment of 

Section 5-A of the Sind 
Act No. XXVI  of 1974.

11.      In the said Act, in section 6, after sub-section (2), the 
following shall be added:- 

 

 

“(3)    A    member    shall    be    entitled    to 

receive  mobile phone charges at the rate of 

ten thousand rupees per month.” 

Amendment of 

Section 6 of the Sind 

Act No. XXVI of 1974.

 

 

12.      In  the  said  Act,  in  section  6-B,  for  the  words  “five 
thousand” the words “eight thousand” shall be substituted. 

Amendment of 
Section 6-B of the Sind 

Act No. XXVI of 1974.

http://sindhlaws.gov.pk/setup/publications_SindhCode/PUB-15-000278.pdf
http://sindhlaws.gov.pk/setup/publications_SindhCode/PUB-15-000278.pdf
http://sindhlaws.gov.pk/setup/publications_SindhCode/PUB-15-000278.pdf
http://sindhlaws.gov.pk/setup/publications_SindhCode/PUB-15-000278.pdf
http://sindhlaws.gov.pk/setup/publications_SindhCode/PUB-15-000278.pdf
http://sindhlaws.gov.pk/setup/publications_SindhCode/PUB-15-000278.pdf
http://sindhlaws.gov.pk/setup/publications_SindhCode/PUB-15-000278.pdf
http://sindhlaws.gov.pk/setup/publications_SindhCode/PUB-15-000278.pdf
http://sindhlaws.gov.pk/setup/publications_SindhCode/PUB-15-000278.pdf
http://sindhlaws.gov.pk/setup/publications_SindhCode/PUB-15-000278.pdf
http://sindhlaws.gov.pk/setup/publications_SindhCode/PUB-15-000278.pdf
http://sindhlaws.gov.pk/setup/publications_SindhCode/PUB-15-000278.pdf
http://sindhlaws.gov.pk/setup/publications_SindhCode/PUB-15-000278.pdf
http://sindhlaws.gov.pk/setup/publications_SindhCode/PUB-15-000278.pdf
http://sindhlaws.gov.pk/setup/publications_SindhCode/PUB-15-000278.pdf
http://sindhlaws.gov.pk/setup/publications_SindhCode/PUB-15-000278.pdf
http://sindhlaws.gov.pk/setup/publications_SindhCode/PUB-15-000278.pdf
http://sindhlaws.gov.pk/setup/publications_SindhCode/PUB-15-000278.pdf


SINDH ACT NO. XXXIV OF 2013. 

THE SINDH ASSEMBLY MEMBERS (SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES) (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2013. 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

3 


