EXTRAORDINARY

Registered No. M 324

The Binvj Guvernivent @ag_e&z

. Published by a\udm‘rh}'

KARACHI,

WEDNESDAY NOVEMBER , 15, 2000

PART I
GOVERNMENT OF SINDH
LAW. DEPARTMENT
. NOTIFICATION
Karachi, the 15th November 2000,

No. SLEGIS:1{14)/2000:—The following Ordinance made by the
Governor of Sindh is hereby publish for general information:—

THE SINDH IRRIGATION. (AMENDMENT) ORDINANGE,2000.
SINDH ORDINANCE No, XIVOF 2000,

AN
ORDINANCE:

to amend the Sindh Irrigation Act, 1879.

WHEREAS it is expedient to amend the Sindh Irrigation Act, Preamble.
1879, in the manner hereinafter appearing;

AND WHEREAS the Provincial Assembly stands suspended

~ In pursuance of the Proclamation of the fourteenth day of October, 1999, and the
Provisional Constitution Order No. | of 1999;

LCiv) 163- EXT-I- 62 1-A ( 12534) Price Rs- 200



1253-8 THE SINDH GOVT GAZETTE EXT MovemBeRIs 2000 PART |- "

AND WHEREAS the Governor of Sindh is satisfied that

circumstances exist which render it necessary to take immediate action;

NOW, TﬂEREFURE, in pursuance of the aforesaid

Proclamation and the Provisional Constitution Order read with Provisional

Short title and
commencement,

Amendment  in
section 61 and
62 of Act VIl of
1579,

Karachi.

Constitution (Amendment) Order No. 9 of 1999, instructions of the Chief
Executive and in exercise of all powers enabling him in that behalf, the Gmernm
of Sindh is pleased to make and promulgate the following Ordinance - '

i

I« (1) This Ordinance may be called the Sindh Irrigation (Amendment)
Ordinance, 2000.

(2) - It shall come into i:”qr;:e on and from Kharif, 2000

2 In the Sindh Irrigation Act, 1879, hereinafter referred to as the
said Act, in section 61, for the words “three months”, the words “two years” and
for words “one thousand rupees”, the words “ten thousand rupees” shall be
substituted.

3 In the said Act, in section 62, for the words “one year”, the words
“three years” and for the words “two thousand rupeaa the words “twenty
thousand rupees” shall be substituted.-

g In the said Ar.,t after section 62-A, the following new section
shall be inserted:-

“62-B _'\Ion-h.a_ilnble offence: An offence

punishable under section &1 or section 62
shall be non-bailable.”.

MOHAMMEDMIAN SOOMRO

Dated: 13" November, 2000 . GOVERNOR OF SINDH

@ G{p Luvt.""r‘ e S%indh

Lawt Departiens

KARACHI: FRINTED AT THE SINDH GOVERNMENT FRESS

({E50Y +6-I-2000 = (0EF5ET)



